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Background/Purpose: Meaningful work is a topic of relevant interest to management and organizational scholars. 
The study of meaningful work has been heavily characterized by theories from different disciplines, yet the com-
mon-sense perspective is often overlooked, i.e., a non-academic perspective of meaningful work. The paper pres-
ents a qualitative study on how non-academics define meaningful work. 
Methods: Adopting the lens of Aristotelian logic, the paper presents a methodological-theoretical approach to 
explore how non-academics define human resource management concepts. We asked 194 workers to propose 
ultimate definitions of the concept of meaningful work. The questions were submitted via a short survey collecting 
demographics. 
Results: The analysis of the collected definitions led to the proposition of an intensive definition of meaningful work 
according to which meaningful work is a positive experience associated with a sense of competence, the presence 
of positive relation with others, significance and purpose of work. Yet, there must be good reasons to experience 
work as meaningful as the environment may contain barriers to the presence of meaningfulness. 
Conclusion: Methodologically, the paper advances a novel approach to the study of human resource management 
and development concepts. Theoretically, the study proposes a novel perspective of meaningful work prioritizing 
concerns on the common-sense.
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1	 Introduction

The phenomenon of meaningful work, the experience 
and perception of work as holding significance, is a topic 
of importance at present for the human resource manage-
ment field and in a variety of domains of research (e.g., 
employee’s wellbeing, job design and corporate social 
responsibility). To date, scholars have been witnessing 

heightened attention on this topic with a burgeoning in-
terest in understanding the contextual factors, relational 
dynamics, and individual processes fostering meaning-
ful work (Yeoman et al. 2019). Unsurprisingly, there are 
as many definitions and theories of meaningful work as 
scholars have studied it: thus, the only thing about which 
authors can agree on meaningful work is that no one can 
agree on what meaningful work really is (Bailey & Mad-
den, 2020; Martikainen et al. 2021).

https://doi.org/10.2478/orga-2023-0006
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In human resource management, organization stud-
ies, and particularly traditional organizational psycholo-
gy, there are many definitions and a lack of clarity about 
what is related to them (Martikainen et al. 2021). Recent 
reviews of the literature (Bailey et al., 2018) have grouped 
the existing definitions into five main categories of studies, 
namely: 

(a) those that draw on the Job Characteristics Model 
with meaningful work defined as a positive psychological 
state part of one’s job (Hackman & Oldham, 1975); 

(b) those within the work spirituality approach with 
meaningful work interpreted as resulting from the balance 
between inner life and occupation (Milliman et al., 2017); 

(c) those within the humanistic tradition who view 
meaningful work as related to the meaning of life 
(Lips-Wiersma & Wright, 2012); 

(d) those who conceptualize meaningful work as a 
multifaceted eudemonic psychological state (Ryff, 2018); 

(e) those who define meaningful work as a specific 
state of occupation according to (Bunderson & Thompson, 
2009). 

In turn, authors interested in approaching meaning-
ful work tend to view different and separate categories 
of meaning of meaningful work as non-exclusive. Such a 
condition makes it difficult to approach meaningful work 
in the organizational context (Michaelson et al., 2014). The 
challenges around meaningful work remain questioning if 
meaningful work represents a greedy ideal that sets up to 
fail, or if individuals really experience and perceive such 
a phenomenon of meaningfulness in contemporary society 
(Carton 2018; Martikainen et al. 2021; Muirhead, 2004).

This is to say that current academic debates embrac-
ing the definition of meaningful work have never benefited 
from the way non-academic individuals define it. Constel-
lations around the meaning of meaningful work have been 
heavily influenced by perspectives belonging to empirical 
and factual studies. These rely on multiple theories and 
tend to infer the presence of meaningful work through ei-
ther deductive or inductive methods. Quantitative inves-
tigations assess the presence of meaningful work (Bailey 
et al., 2018; Bailey & Madden 2017; Martikainen et al., 
2021), while qualitative inquiries are usually limited to 
descriptions of specific experiences and shared affective 
states (Carton 2018). As recently stated by Lips-Wiersma 
and her colleagues (2022), it is difficult for people to talk 
about meaningful work and to explain what meaning-
ful work means to them. In turn, the examination of the 
characteristics and discourses of meaningful work from a 
common-sense perspective has never been present in the 
literature. Studying how individuals are capable to define 
– or articulate definitions of – meaningful work can be 
particularly relevant for scholars striving to find concrete 
definitions of such an abstract concept. Perhaps, concep-
tual ambiguity around the notion of meaningful work due 
to the lack of agreement among academic authors may 

also suggest conceptual ambiguity among (working) in-
dividuals. Considering the common-sense perspectives as 
a source of unique and concrete knowledge, speculation 
about the meaning of meaningful work may not meet the 
subjective instances. 

In this paper, we report our attempt to address this gap 
by reaching a definition of the phenomenon of meaning-
ful work via a common-sense perspective. Notably, the 
overarching aim of this study is to address the question, 
“What is the perspective on meaningful work based on a 
common-sense definition, and how can this perspective in-
form theory and practice in human resource management 
and development?”. Studying common-sense perspective 
allows us to examine how non-academics define mean-
ingfulness when related to work, while simultaneously 
presenting the elements which foster meaningful work. 
Based on the Aristotelian logic of definition, we conducted 
a qualitative study to explore the common-sense perspec-
tive of meaningful work. This can contribute to scientific 
knowledge by envisioning guidance on the subjective, so-
cial, and institutional elements associated with defining, 
providing, and protecting meaningful work. Although 
common-sense perspective is not historically present in 
the literature, examining how individuals propose shared 
definitions of such a phenomenon can reveal insights for 
contemporary discourse and practice on meaningful work.

We proceed as follows. First, we briefly discuss the use 
of common-sense perspective to explore notions and con-
cepts of human resource management and development 
literature, e.g., meaningful work. We propose the radical 
revocation of the subject of work using common-sense 
perspective by referring to the Aristotelian logic of defi-
nition. Second, we present the methodology used to col-
lect definitions of meaningful work from non-academics 
to reconstruct the meaning of meaningful work. Lastly, we 
discuss our findings by exchanging current definitions of 
meaningful work with interdisciplinary references to lit-
erature in management, human resource development and 
organizational psychology in order to complement and ex-
pand the perspective on meaningful work. Our discussion 
serves to offer resources for understanding, evaluating, 
and fostering meaningful work within the context of hu-
man resource management.

2	 Common-sense perspective and 
management studies

Revoking the primacy of the subject on defining their 
experience is historically not a new way of doing research 
in the field of human resource management and develop-
ment. Indeed, it would be a mistake to take the idea of 
common-sense perspective as being opposed to factual, 
intellectual, or theoretical knowledge. Central argument 
on the continuity is that non-academics have always 
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questioned and proposed their definition of phenomena 
beyond narrow and strict epistemological and methodo-
logical reasoning. According to Heider’s (1958) definition 
of common-sense perspective “[it] has a great and deep 
understanding of himself [sic] and other people which [is] 
unformulated or only vaguely conceived” (p. 2). Com-
mon-sense perspective includes ordinary people’s ideas 
about their behavior and the behavior of others and the 
backgrounds and effects of that behavior. This common-
sense is expressed in language that we, as ordinary people, 
use to refer to people and stories we tell each other about 
one person, people, and types of people (Heider, 1958; 
Kelley, 1992; Smedslund, 2013).

Common-sense and studies in human resource man-
agement and development are not separate. Conversely, 
there is a close relationship between academic knowledge 
and common-sense. First, studies within and human re-
source management and development necessarily stems 
from common-sense questions (Sartori et al., 2022). It is 
therefore erroneous to assume that such studies should 
not question how common-sense answers are similar to 
research questions. In this sense, common-sense can con-
tribute to the cognitive development of organizational phe-
nomena. Simultaneously, organizational studies influence 
common-sense by suggesting abstract ideas and perspec-
tives (Heider, 1958; Kelley, 1992). Hence, there are many 
reasons to think of continuity between academic studies 
and common-sense perspectives, although few studies 
have questioned how common-sense can define concepts 
and theories specific to the field (Smedslund, 2013).

In the study of meaningful work, useful and interesting 
data and perspectives emerge from the different definitions 
proposed and the various theories referred to. However, 
these data and perspectives are unable to directly answer 
the question of whether ordinary people can define the 
concept of meaningful work. This is because present stud-
ies within the literature indirectly analyses such an individ-
ual ability of proposing definitions on meaningful work. 
Most of the theories around meaningful work in human 
resource management are generally deduced without ref-
erence to common-sense. For example, qualitative studies 
about meaningful work generally consist of collecting and 
analysing accounts of meaningful experiences. Others, 
however, tend to look at examples of meaningful experi-
ences at work. Consequently, naive definitions, i.e., com-
mon-sense, are deduced as a posteriori.

From an epistemological point of view, such proposi-
tions and data on the topic of meaningful work thus tend 
to provide definitions based on the way knowledge is rep-
resented by non-academic subjects. However, the knowl-
edge representation of a concept, e.g., meaningful work, is 
not the definition of the concept itself. First, the knowledge 
representation of a concept concerns the body of knowl-
edge related to that concept derived from experience and 
learning. Second, concept definition itself concerns the 

precise act of verbalizing the salient features of a given 
concept. Following classical Aristotelian logic, the pur-
pose of the process of definition is to reduce uncertainty 
around a term of discourse (B, definiendum) by resolving 
its meaning into that of other terms (A, definiens) whose 
intelligibility has already been given. According to this as-
sumption, two types of definitions can be proposed: classi-
cal definitions and intensive or attribute definitions. In the 
first case, these are definitions in which the attributes are 
clear (definiens) and sufficiently explanatory. However, 
such definitions are rather rare to obtain and mainly con-
cern the second case, i.e., intensive definitions. These are 
based on the absence of sufficiently explanatory attributes 
and mainly reflect what constitutes the concept beyond its 
representativeness. Ultimately, the definitions of a concept 
may be for specific extensible attributes (classical defini-
tions), which can however be enriched and clarified by ex-
amples (intensive definitions) (Agassi & Wettersten, 1987; 
Parry & Hacker, 1991).

From a pragmatic point of view, studying the com-
mon-sense perspective requires a formal research ap-
proach aimed at collecting classical and per-attribute defi-
nitions of a given concept. Non-academics are generally 
not inclined to formulate definitions concerning academic 
phenomena and therefore these must be questioned and so-
licited explicitly. This implies that there are different types 
of questions that can be asked characterized by varying 
degrees of precision, structuring and abstraction. Again, 
there may be different degrees of knowledge on the part 
of the participants. For this reason, the questions must be 
structured according to three levels of formalization of the 
definition, namely 1) analogy, 2) generalization, and 3) ex-
planation. Following classical logic, we first have formula-
tion by analogy, asking questions that prompt participants 
to indicate whether A (definiens) resembles B (definien-
dum) through associations of ideas. Second, formulation 
by generalizations whereby the question prompts partici-
pants to indicate the set of attributes that make A similar 
to B. Lastly, the question by explanation asks to indicate 
the set of attributes of A that are necessary and sufficient 
to identify B through causal explanatory reasoning. In the 
case of the study of the concept of meaningful work, the 
question for analogy can be rendered in a request such as 
“Can you define the concept of meaningful work for me 
through some examples?”. In the second case, the question 
is asked “Can you define the concept of meaningful work 
for me by thinking about its characteristics?”. In the third 
case, the question is asked by considering several aspects 
at the same time: “Can you define the concept of mean-
ingful work for me by indicating what considerations are 
necessary and essential for having this experience?”.
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3	 Methods

3.1	Procedure and Participants

Considering the assumptions of the classic logic for 
collecting the common-sense perspective, we encouraged 
individuals through explicit requests to revoke their sub-
jective perspectives on the meaning of meaningful work. 
The requests referred to one out of the three open questions 
previously described, i.e., definition based on 1) analogy, 
2) generalization or 3) explanation. That is, one group of 
respondents had to respond to an open question about pro-
posing a definition of meaningful work based via analogy 
(i.e., Could you define the concept of meaningful work 
through some examples? Group 1). The second group 
had to respond to the open question for a general defini-
tion (Could you define the concept of meaningful work by 
thinking about its characteristics? Group 2), while the third 
group had a question asking for an explanation (Could you 
define the concept of meaningful work by indicating what 
considerations are necessary and essential for having this 
experience? Group 3). 

Participants were invited via emails to voluntary fill in 
the online questionnaire. In the email text, we informed the 
participants about the study and asked them to contribute. 
A link to access the online survey was reported allowing 
participation at a time convenient to them. After reading 
the description of the study, and privacy rules, they were 
asked to sign the informed consent in order to use the data 
for the purpose of the study. Completion of the question-
naire took about five minutes. We sent the questionnaire to 
N = 197 Italian employees among which only n = 194 par-
ticipants (56.1%, N = 109 females, average age 41 years, 
SD = 14) voluntarily completed the questionnaire. Partici-
pants were randomly assigned to one of the three research 
groups mentioned above (i.e., 40.7%, N = 79, Group 1, 
17.5%, N = 34, Group 2, and 41.8%, N = 81, Group 3). All 
data were anonymized right after collection and a unique 
numerical ID was assigned to each completed question-
naire. 

The study has been approved by the ethical committee 
of the University of the first Author, according to the dec-
laration of Helsinki.

3.2	Analytical Strategy

The analytic strategy of the definitions collected con-
sisted into three main phases using the content analysis 
approach. These were conducted by Author 1 and Author 
2 who developed the study in collaboration with Author 
3 who was not aware about the aim of the study. During 
phase 1, the three researchers worked individually and 
identified the sub-categories of meaning within all the 

definitions collected. Then, the three researchers compared 
their analysis and agreed about the ultimate sub-catego-
ries. Simultaneously, descriptive statistics with frequen-
cies tables indicated whether certain sub-categories of 
meaningful work were prevalent and/or specific for each 
group. Second, the three researchers worked together to 
identify the specific meso-categories covering the different 
units identified. Then, they identified the salient themes, 
namely the macro-categories grouping all the meso-cat-
egories of meaning. This coding phase involved a more 
abstract analysis of the data through macro categories that 
could lead to definitions of meaningful work phenomenon 
through the participants’ perspectives. In the last phase, 
each of the researchers derived a definition of meaningful 
work in addition to the identification of the factors under-
pinning the phenomenon.

4	 Results

Results cover definitions of meaningful, the descrip-
tions of work and the diverse reflexive or critical stand-
points leading to the experience and perception of mean-
ingful work. In particular, the resulting analysis led to one 
broad definition of meaningful work and two framings of 
the factors related to meaningful work. 

First, following the data analytic strategy, the initial 
step of Phase 1 led to the identification of sub-categories of 
meaning covering aspects related to meaningful work. By 
comparing our individual results, we agreed on the final 
set of N = 29 sub-categories. These covered both aspects 
related to the meaning of meaningful work itself and the 
conditions under which work is experienced and perceived 
as meaningful. Of the 29 categories, one category called 
“Problem with questions” was used to categorize all those 
answers where the participants reported that they were not 
able to understand the question about meaningful work 
(11.9%, n = 23). Another category, referred to those who 
reported that meaningful work does not exist arguing that 
work cannot be experienced as something meaningful due 
to specific job conditions (e.g., exploitation) and/or soci-
etal problems (7.3%, n = 14). The rest of the categories 
spanned from 1) intra/inter-individual dimensions such as 
calling, work passion, and sense of competence, 2) rela-
tional aspects as the connection between others and sense 
of contribution, and 3) societal-organizational aspects such 
as organizational conditions, and participation in business 
and society.

Second, during phase 2, we proceeded with the iden-
tification of meso-categories by analysing the sub-catego-
ries. After that, we identified meso-categories grouping 
the sub-categories into the following 9 meso-categories: 
1) sense of competence, 2) calling, 3) purposeful task, 4) 
sense of relatedness, 5-6) salary & career barriers, 7) or-
ganizational policies, 8) organizational conditions partici-
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pation in society, and 9) work as not-a-source of meaning.
Lastly, during phase 3, we grouped these 9 meso-cate-

gories into macro-categories relating to meaningful work. 
Accordingly, we identified the following four macro-cat-
egories: 1) meaningful work as an individual-based phe-
nomenon, 2) meaningful work as work-based phenome-
non, 3) meaningful work as an environmental-dependent 
phenomenon and 4) meaningful work compromised by 
impeding conditions of the workplace.

4.1	Common-sense & meaningful work 

Following the analysis of the identified macro-catego-
ries, we advanced a definition of meaningful work and its 
conditions. According to the common-sense perspective, 
we define the concept of meaningful work as the experi-
ence and perception of meaning in work which is closely 
related to the task performed (Allan et al., 2017) and mas-
tering skills at work (Martela & Reikki, 2018), but it is also 
dependent on the presence of positive conditions at the or-
ganizational and societal levels (Lysova et al., 2019; Tom-
masi et al., 2020) which may decrease the meaning-mak-
ing of individuals.

Firstly, independently of the type of question, partic-
ipants reported that tasks at work play a crucial role for 
them to experience and perceive their work as meaningful. 
Work is not meaningful per se and there are no occupa-
tion-based differences. Conversely, the meaning attrib-
uted by individuals depends on the possibility to express 
the individuals’ know-how via significant and purposeful 
tasks allowing for self-actualization and self-expression. 
Moreover, participants discussed meaningful work to be 
both a permanent mindset and an episodic experience 
which appear on the continuum temporal axis of working 
experience and are strongly determined by intraindividu-
al, relational, organizational, and institutional conditions 
(Tommasi et al., 2020).

Secondly, most of the responses of the participants 
contained a marked reference to the self and factors in-
extricably linked to personal characteristics. Specifically, 
participants used concepts such as pride, sense of impor-
tance in fulfilling their role, passion, commitment, and se-
renity derived from work, to explain the role of work in 
giving meaning and completeness to daily life. Most of 
the participants identified the sense of importance derived 
from work as the most relevant personal characteristic in 
defining this experience. However, above all the categories 
used, at the individual level, participants reported defini-
tions of meaningful work by referring to their know-how 
(i.e., sense of competence) while echoing the crucial role 
of significance of the task. Lastly, participation in organi-
zational life and society was reported as one of the sources 
of meaningfulness suggesting the relational and environ-
mental dependence of such a phenomenon.

Lastly, participants argued about the absence of mean-
ing when these aspects were decreased by the presence 
of certain work-barriers, societal and labour market con-
ditions. Factors such as company policies, organizational 
change and training, the match between fatigue and work, 
work tasks as a tool for achieving a goal, work tasks per-
formed for others, and serenity resulting from work were 
reported to be as the main sources of both meaningful 
work and the absence of meaning.

5	 Discussion

Meaningful work is at the core of the most relevant do-
mains of research in human resource management and de-
velopment (Lips-Wiersma et al., 2018). Moreover, mean-
ingfulness represents a moral and pragmatic concern for 
workers, organizations, and systems (Yeoman et al., 2019) 
beyond the multiple positive outcomes at the individual 
and organizational levels (Allan et al., 2019). Given such 
endeavours in human resource management and develop-
ment studies and the relevance of such a phenomenon, there 
is an imperative for conducting investigations on meaning-
ful work. Particularly, investigations on the meaning and 
the conditions of meaningful work are welcomed. In the 
present article, we aimed to contribute to such reflections 
by revoking the primacy of the subject in defining their 
experience. Using Aristotelian logic, the purpose of this 
study was to understand whether non-academics are able 
to define, and how they define meaningful work. Results 
of our qualitative study based on open questions on how to 
define meaningful work led to initial pieces of knowledge. 
These results can be taken into account against evidence 
and critical reflections on meaningful work present in con-
temporary literature. Ultimately, our results can serve to 
propose indications for future research and practice.

First, echoing the recent work by Bailey and col-
leagues (2022), we found that people have limited words 
to talk about meaningful work and that they may have dif-
ficulties in finding answers to the question “what is mean-
ingful work”? We noted this by reading answers such as 
“I don’t understand the question” and “I don’t know what 
meaningful work is or should be” but also in the words 
used to present the linguistic meaning of meaningful work 
as well as for the examples of what meaningful work is. 
Nevertheless, the analysis of the participants’ answers to 
the three types of questions showed that subjects have the 
capacity to provide meaningful definitions containing el-
ements that are known, understandable, and common to 
the three required definitions. As mentioned, most of the 
answers were focused on intra/inter- individual aspects re-
lated to 1) personal characteristics and 2) aspects of the 
job. Another substantial portion of the answers focused 
on the environmental aspects related to 3) working and 
organizational conditions, and 4) socio-political context. 
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This resonates with the methodological framework of the 
present paper: namely, even non-academic individuals are 
able to provide intensive definitions of work and organi-
zational phenomena. Although the degrees of complexity 
of the responses differ among the three types of responses, 
individuals responded to the explicit request to define the 
concept of meaningful work by producing answers (i.e., 
definitions) according to denotative aspects. That is, inde-
pendently of the way a quest for definition is presented 
(i.e., classical or intensive), individuals propose a verbal 
description characterized by a diachronic and explanatory 
structure rather than a prototypical type. This is in contrast 
with what happens in the world of academic definitions 
where proposals for definitions tend to be structured via 
a prototypical type. In contrast, common-sense definitions 
are more dynamic and structural with the aim of propos-
ing generic definitions which capture personal experiences 
of meaningful work. Moreover, these results inform also 
how ordinary, non-academic people are somewhat inter-
ested in providing explanations and definitions of their life 
and work experiences. Even more, non-academics appear 
to be interested in formulating tentative theories about the 
causes and consequences of certain experiences. The re-
sulting common-sense formulations tended to explain the 
phenomenon of meaningful work on the basis of different 
and separate factors. Notably, non-academics formulate 
theories and reasoning that invoke various perspectives 
and studies of meaningful work in the areas of manage-
ment, human resource development and organizational 
psychology.

Second, an interesting (common-sense) perspective 
emerged by considering the findings as opposed to what 
exists in the literature. This also can help to find an ini-
tial definition of meaningful work. First, such a perspec-
tive resonates with the definitions which are used in the 
literature according to which meaningful work represents 
a positive experience at work (Lysova et al., 2019; Rosso 
et al., 2010; Tommasi et al., 2020) given by the possibil-
ity of self-actualization and self-development via work 
(Yeoman et al., 2020). In this regard, central aspects for 
the discovery, experience and perception of meaningful-
ness in work are the presence of purpose (Martela & Pes-
si, 2018), the relationship with others (Martela & Reikki, 
2018), the presence of significant tasks (Allan, 2017) and 
a sense of competence (Lips-Wierisma & Morris, 2009). 
According to the common-sense perspective, meaningful 
work would be determined by organizational dimensions 
such as a sense of belonging (Schnell et al., 2013; Sch-
nell & Hoffmann, 2020; Tommasi et al., 2021; Tommasi 
et al., 2022). Indeed, such a definition covers aspects of 
meaningful work as an environmental dependent phenom-
enon. The environment presents conditions such as the 
possibilities for development and growth which have been 
described by the participants as possible impediments to 
meaningful work if they are lacking at an organizational 

level. Further impediments are given at the socio-political 
level. Recalling various perspectives from the literature, 
the dimension of meaningful work is strongly linked to 
institutions (Lysova, et al., 2019; Michaelson, 2021) and 
to the socio-political context (Tommasi et al., 2020). Our 
participants indicated that changes in the world of work, 
the lack of job protection and the frequency of the risk of 
labour exploitation represent impediments to the discovery 
of meaningful work. In this spirit, the results of the present 
study echo scholars who have recently highlighted the pos-
sibility that work can be meaningful only if there are good 
reasons for experiencing it as such (Tyssedal, 2022). The 
perspective of our participants suggests that the dimension 
of meaningful work should be understood on a subjective 
level in contrast to an ideal of meaningful work as imbued 
by contemporary society. The phenomenon of meaningful 
work, therefore, seems to have a character of subjective 
uniqueness. However, this uniqueness must be sought in 
the whole of the different and seperate elements that com-
pose meaningful work itself.

Besides theoretical implications, to our knowledge this 
is the primary direct investigation on the common-sense 
perspective of academic concepts in the area of human 
resource management and development. Moreover, this is 
a primary direct investigation on how non-academic are 
able to define meaningful work. As such, this study offers 
a number of methodological and research implications for 
future directions in the study of meaningful work. Meth-
odologically, our approach based on the Aristotelian log-
ic of definition can be used for additional investigations 
on constructs and concepts in the area of human resource 
management, organization studies and organizational psy-
chology. It is interesting to note the presence or absence 
of associations, as well as different perspectives between 
academic and non-academic. Considering individual, re-
lational and organizational dimensions and how these are 
treated in organizational settings, revoking the subject per-
spective can help to ensure that both academic knowledge 
and practices reflect the individual experience. Moreover, 
it is also interesting to note that our pieces of empirical 
knowledge suggest that non-academics have the capacity 
to advance intensive definitions as well as unique perspec-
tives. This result strengths the potential of our approach of 
revoking the subject into academic perspectives.

With respect to the study of meaningful work, our re-
sults point to consider the possibility that participants of 
empirical studies might not understand or reflect questions 
and items used to investigate meaningful work. For further 
studies, it would be interesting to replicate the study by 
including measures of meaningful work to see how quali-
tative definitions reflect quantitative results and vice versa. 
In addition, further studies might replicate this study by 
taking into account a larger sample of participants includ-
ing different cultural aspects as well as various occupa-
tions. As a preliminary investigation, the collected sample 
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did not include such differences. However, cultural differ-
ences might reflect specific aspects of meaningful work. 
Likewise, different dimensions of meaningful work might 
have a relevance for various kinds of occupations.

5.1	Practical implications

Our findings can be of value to human resource man-
agement scholars who are interested in proposing organ-
izational interventions. First, the research design of the 
present study echoes recent calls for engaging employees 
in talking about meaningful work (Lips-Wiersma et al., 
2022). The semantic and linguistic issues revealed in our 
study show how people are rarely engaged with questions 
around meaning and meaningfulness. Despite this, our 
study shows that they are actually able to propose inten-
sive definitions by presenting the situation in which they 
are capable to experience and discover meaningfulness 
at work. Following this result, employers and managers 
could ask their employees about the meaning they attach to 
their work and whether they have or have not good reasons 
to experience their work as meaningful. Such an organ-
izational survey may inform possible effective ways for 
fostering meaningfulness at work (Tommasi et al., 2020). 
Second, our results show how individuals can experience 
and perceive their work as meaningful by referring to 
their task significance (Allan, 2017), sense of competence 
(Martela & Riekki, 2018), and relations with others (Mar-
tela & Riekki, 2018). In turn, job design intervention could 
be implemented to address the way work is organized and 
its characteristics (Bailey & Madden, 2020). For example, 
training interventions could foster skills and competencies 
among employees in order to improve their sense of com-
petence. Simultaneously, interventions at the team level 
could foster positive relations associated with meaningful 
work. 

Lastly, our results suggest that there are certain organ-
izational and institutional barriers which may decrease 
the presence of positive experiences at work, such as 
meaningful work. Managers could consider possible or-
ganizational barriers and support human resource devel-
opment in order to foster meaningfulness. First, echoing 
the recent work by Baily and colleagues (2022), we found 
that people have limited words to talk about meaningful 
work and that they may have difficulties in finding an-
swers to the question “what is meaningful work”? We 
noted this by reading answers such as “I don’t understand 
the question” and “I don’t know what meaningful work 
is or should be” but also in the words used to present the 
linguistic meaning of meaningful work as well as for the 
examples of what meaningful work is. Nevertheless, the 
content analysis of the participants’ answers to the three 
types of questions showed that subjects have the capaci-
ty to provide meaningful definitions containing elements 

that are known, understandable, and common to the three 
required definitions. As mentioned, most of the answers 
were focused on intra/inter- individual aspects related to 
1) personal characteristics and 2) aspects of the job. An-
other substantial portion of the answers focused on the 
environmental aspects related to 3) working and organiza-
tional conditions, and 4) socio-political context. This res-
onates with the methodological framework of the present 
paper: namely, even non-academic individuals are able to 
provide intensive definitions of work and organizational 
phenomena. Although the degrees of complexity of the 
responses differ among the three types of responses, in-
dividuals responded to the explicit request to define the 
concept of meaningful work by producing answers (i.e., 
definitions) according to denotative aspects. That is, inde-
pendently of the way a quest for definition is presented 
(i.e., classical or intensive), individuals propose a verbal 
description characterized by a diachronic and explanatory 
structure rather than a prototypical type. This is in contrast 
with what happens in the world of academic definitions 
where proposals for definitions tend to be structured via 
a prototypical type. In contrast, common-sense definitions 
are more dynamic and structural with the aim of propos-
ing generic definitions which capture personal experiences 
of meaningful work. Moreover, these results inform how 
ordinary, non-academic people are somewhat interested 
in providing explanations and definitions of their life and 
work experiences. Even more, non-academics appear to 
be interested in formulating tentative theories about the 
causes and consequences of certain experiences. The re-
sulting common-sense formulations tended to explain the 
phenomenon of meaningful work on the basis of various 
and different factors. In particular, non-academics formu-
late theories and reasoning that invoke various perspec-
tives and studies of meaningful work in the areas of man-
agement, human resource development and organizational 
psychology.

5.2	Limitations

Lastly, we must acknowledge some limitations of the 
current study, with findings having to be interpreted with 
some caution. Indeed, we limited our data collection to 
those who decided to voluntarily participate in the study. 
Also, our sample was limited to only 194 participants, 
and we did not have participants from specific job classes. 
Further studies may address this limit by carrying out a 
more extensive survey of different workers from multiple 
disciplines. Although this aspect does not affect the impli-
cations of our results per se, it may limit the extensiveness 
of our interpretation which could be enriched by further 
studies on the common-sense perspective.
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6	 Conclusion

The present study provides indications for theory, re-
search and practice in the field of studies on meaningful 
work. Firstly, this study provides an initial basis for under-
standing the potential of inquiring non-academics about 
the meaning of meaningful work and how non-academics 
are capable of offering novel perspectives on it. Second-
ly, we present a conceptual background for theorizing and 
testing possible interventions aimed at fostering meaning-
ful work. Thirdly, we offer an initial frame of orientation 
for scoping out the common-sense perspective by which 
further critical investigation can be advanced in the em-
pirical investigations in human resource management and 
development. In closing, we invite scholars to address 
current debates around notions and concepts in the liter-
ature to look at how non-academics may engage, subvert, 
criticize, and renovate the meaning and relevance of this 
phenomenon.
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Razkrivanje zdravorazumskega pogleda na smiselno delo: teorija, podatki in posledice za upravljanje in 
razvoj človeških virov

Ozadje/namen: Smiselno delo je tema, ki je pomembna za strokovnjake s področja managementa in organizacij. 
Preučevanje smiselnega dela je bilo močno zaznamovano s teorijami iz različnih disciplin, vendar je zdravorazum-
ska perspektiva pogosto spregledana, tj. neakademska perspektiva smiselnega dela. Članek predstavlja kvalitativ-
no študijo o tem, kako ne-akademiki opredeljujejo smiselno delo.
Metode: Prispevek s pomočjo aristotelovske logike predstavlja metodološko-teoretični pristop k raziskovanju, kako 
ne-akademiki opredeljujejo koncepte upravljanja človeških virov. 194 zaposlenih smo prosili, da predlagajo končne 
definicije pojma smiselnega dela. Vprašanja so bila poslana prek kratke ankete, ki je zbirala tudi demografske po-
datke.
Rezultati: Analiza zbranih definicij je privedla do predloga intenzivne definicije smiselnega dela, po kateri je smisel-
no delo pozitivna izkušnja, povezana z občutkom kompetentnosti, prisotnostjo pozitivnega odnosa z drugimi, pome-
nom in namenom dela. Vendar pa morajo obstajati dobri razlogi, da delo doživljamo kot smiselno, saj lahko okolje 
vsebuje ovire za prisotnost smiselnosti.
Zaključek: Metodološko prispevek uveljavlja nov pristop k preučevanju konceptov upravljanja s človeškimi viri in 
razvoja. Teoretično študija predlaga novo perspektivo smiselnega dela, ki daje prednost zdravemu razumu.

Ključne besede: Smiselno delo, Zdrava pamet, Dobro počutje zaposlenih, Upravljanje in razvoj človeških virov


